
 

Customer Expert Day - 28/07/2020 

Questions & Answers: 

Question Answer 

What about the rejection whereby the asset 
model data does not match that held by gas 
transporter? 

The MDD rejection relating to Asset Model 
data is “Asset Model data not consistent 
with UK Link Asset Model data” this rejection 
reason is covered within the training pack 
from slide 51. If you are referring to another 
rejection reason that wasn’t covered please 
do not hesitate to contact us. 

what a CDJOB is and how it differs from an 
ONJOB? 

.CDJ (Connection/Disconnection 
Information File) is an abbreviation of 
CDJOB. A CDJ file is a notification that is 
sent to a Shipper that supplies an MPRN 
when data relating to that MPRN data has 
been updated to the Connection & 
Disconnection (C&D) store. 

Is it possible to amend the AQ from a 
previous date to fix Market breaker 
rejections? 

The Rolling AQ calculation and the AQ 
correction processes only set the AQ for a 
future date. Where readings are replaced, 
and a revised volume/energy is calculated 
any future AQ calculations will utilise this 
revised data. However, as part of the AQ 
correction process, a failed energy for 
tolerance reading, can be provided in the 
U01 record of the AQI file as part of reason 
code 4. Where the AQ correction is 
accepted and the provided reading passes 
validation using the ‘new AQ’, the reading 
will also be uploaded. 

Would a 07117-rejection response from an 
ONAGE flow have the same rejection reason 
(e.g. Not being the confirmed shipper for that 
date)?  
 

MDD Rejection responses should remain the 
same throughout the RGMA process. 
Xoserve do not have visibility of an ONAGE 
flow however all rejection codes should 
remain the same throughout the industry. 

The Map Catalogue would be really helpful 
we experience the same issues 

As part of XRN 4801 we are looking to get 
Meter Asset Provider (MAP) details on to the 
Data Enquiry System. The “MAP ID” (If 
populated on UK Link) will be visible after 
implementation of XRN 4801 during the 
November 2020 UK Link Release drop. 
Alternatively, as part of XRN 4780-C a new 
file is being created (.SIM) to be issued to 



 

 

 

If you have any additional questions that are not answered above please contact box.xoserve.training2@xoserve.com  

 

Shippers informing them where MAP ID, 
associated with assets installed in their 
Supply Meter Points, has been assigned and 
unassigned. 

Is there any scope or possibility to allow 
updates to the ONUPD process? 

Several RGMA reviews are taking place 
throughout the industry. However, any 
proposed enhancements to the current 
processes would have to go through the 
current change process. More information 
on the Xoserve Change Process can be 
found here:  https://www.xoserve.com/change/ 
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